
1 



2 



3 

indiapolicy@gmail.com 

 www.indiapolicyfoundation.org 

 

 

©  

http://www.indiapolicyfoundation.org/


4 



5 



                                                           
 

 



6 

Custodian 

                                                           
 



7 

Evacuee Property Act 

                                                                                                                                                         

 



8 



9 

I 

                                                           
1

 



10 

                                                           
2
 Government will redraw enemy property bill   



11 



12 

                                                           
3

 Raja of Mehmoodabad to be biggest beneficiary’ 

Enemy Property Act amended—Raja of Memoodabad to benefit: Chidambaram 

spars with Khurshid calls him activist Government 

succumbs: Mehmoodabad Raja wins,  
4
 



13 

                                                           
5
  

6
 Enemy Property Bill: unraveling its background,  



14 

(Mass Contact Programme) 

      





 

                                                           
7
 From a Hotel: the story of a Nawab and his Tenant,  



15 

II  



16 

(Vested Property Act) 

                                                           
8
  



17 

(Evaquee 

Property) 

Evaquee Property 

Evaquee Property 

(Evacuee Property Act) 





 



18 

 

III 

‘Delhi High 

Court curbs Enemy Property Act ordinance enforcement’ 

‘Delhi land 

mafia gobbles up 200 enemy properties’ 

‘Ban on registry of enemy properties’ 



19 

‘Government bans sale of land left 

behind during partition’ 



20 

‘Land mafia 

in Delhi’ 

‘Bitter Reality’ 



21 

‘Three Plots of land and a missing begum’ 







22 

IV  



23 



24 

                                                           
9
  

10
  



25 



26 

                                                           
11

  



27 







 



28 

V 



29 

                                                           
12

 
 



30 





 

                                                           
13

  
14

 Lunch With BS: Mohammad Amir 

Mohammad ‘Sulaiman’ Khan 



31 

 

VI 



32 



33 



34 

 





                                                           
15

  
16

  
17

  



35 

 

Bill No. 75 of 2010 

 

The Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) 

Bill, 2010 

 

A 

BILL 

Further a amend the Enemy Property Act, 1968 and the Public Premises 

(Eviction of Unauthorized Occupants) Act, 1971 

Be it enacted by Parliament in the Sixty-first Year of the Republic of 

India as follow:- 

1. (1) the act may be called the Enemy Property (Amendment and 

Validation) Act, 2010. 

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force on the 2
nd

 day of July, 

2010. 

2. On and from the date of commencement of the Enemy Property Act, 

1968 (hereinafter referred to as the principal Act), in section 5, after sub-

section (2), the following shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have been 

inserted namely:- 

(3) The Enemy property vested in the Custodian shall, notwithstanding 

that the enemy or the enemy subject or the enemy firm has ceased to be an 

enemy due to death, extinction, winding up of business or change of 

nationality or that the legal heir and successor is a citizen of India or the citizen 



36 

of a country which is not an enemy, continue to remain vested in the Custodian 

till it is divested by the Central Government. 

Explanation- For the purpose of this section, "enemy property vested in 

the Custodian" shall include all titles, rights and interest in, or any benefit 

arising out of, such property vested in him under the Act. 

3. After section 5 of the principal Act, the following section shall be 

interested, namely: 

"5A. The Custodian may, after making such inquiry as he deems 

necessary, by order, declare that the property of the enemy or the enemy 

subject or the enemy firm described in the order, vests in him under the Act 

and issue a certificate to this effect and such certificate shall be the evidence of 

the facts stated therein." 

4. on and from the date of commencement of the principal Act, in section 

6, the following Explanation shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have 

been inserted, namely:- 

"Explanation- For the removal of doubts, it is hereby declared that, for 

the purposes of this section, the transfer of any enemy property shall not 

include nay transfer or any claim of transfer made- 

(a) Through oral will or oral gift; or 

(b) By concealment of enemy nationality; or 

(c) In case the transfer of such property require the permission of the 

Reserve Bank of India or any other competent authority, without such 

permission; or 

(d) Without the permission of the Custodian." 

5. In section 8 of the principal Act, in sub-section (2)- 

(a) After clause (i), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:- 



37 

"(ia) fix and collect the rent, standard rent, lease rent, license fee or usage 

charges, as the case may be, in respect of enemy property." 

(b) after clause (iv), the following clause shall be inserted, namely:- 

"(iva) secure vacant possession of the enemy property by evicting from 

the unauthorized or illegal occupant or trespasser and remove unauthorized or 

illegal constructions, if any." 

6. After section 10 of the principal Act, the following section shall be 

inserted namely:- 

"10A. (1) where the Custodian proposes to sell any enemy immovable 

property vested in him, as referred to in section 8, to any person, he may on 

receipt of the sale proceeds of such property, issue a certificate of sale in favor 

of such person and such property have not been handed over to the transferee, 

be valid and conclusive proof of ownership of such property by such person. 

(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in any law for the time being in 

force, the certificate of sale, referred to in sub-section (1), issued by the 

Custodian shall be a valid instrument for the registration of the property in 

favor of the transferee and the registration in respect of enemy property for 

which such certificate of sale had been issued by the Custodian, shall not be 

refused on the ground of lack of original title deeds in respect of such property 

or for any such other reason." 

7. in section 11 of the principal act, after sub-section (2), The following 

sub-section shall be inserted, namely:- 

"(3) the Custodian, Deputy Custodian or Assistant Custodian shall have 

for the purposes of exercising powers or discharging powers of discharging his 

functions under this Act, the same powers as are vested in civil court under the 

Code of Civil procedure, 1908, while dealing with any case under this Act, in 

respect of the following matters, namely:- 

(a) Requiring the discovery and inspection of document; 



38 

(b) Enforcing the attendance of any person, including any officer dealing 

with land, revenue and registration matters, banking officer or officer of a 

company and examining him on oath; 

(c) Compelling, the production of books, document and other records; 

and 

(d) Issuing commissions for the examination of witness or document." 

8. in Section 17 of the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the words 

"two per centum", at both the places where they occur, the words "five per 

centum" shall be substituted. 

9. On and from the date of commencement of the principal Act, after 

section 18, the following section shall be inserted and shall be deemed to have 

been inserted, namely:- 

"18A. Any income received in respect of the enemy property by the 

Custodian shall not, notwithstanding that such property had been divested or 

transferred to any other person, be returned or liable to be returned to such 

person or any other person unless so directed by order, by the Central 

Government." 

10. After section 18A of the principal Act, {as so inserted by section 9 of 

this Act}, the following section shall be inserted, namely:- 

"18B. No court shall have jurisdiction to order divestment from the 

Custodian of enemy property vested in him under this Act or direct the Central 

Government is an enemy property or not. 

18C. the Central Government may, by general or special order, direct 

that any or all enemy property vested in the Custodian under this Act shall be 

sold or disposed off in such manner as may be prescribed." 

11. In section 20 of the principal Act, in sub-section (3), for the words 

"five hundred rupees", the words "ten thousand rupees" shall be substituted. 



39 

12. in section 23 of the principal Act, in Sub-section (2), after clause (d), 

the following clause shall be inserted, namely:- 

"(da) the manner of sale or disposal the enemy property vested in the 

Custodian under section 18C;" 

13. After section 25 of the principal Act, the following section shall be 

inserted, namely:- 

"26, Notwithstanding anything contained in nay judgment, decree or 

order of any court, tribunal or other authority- 

(a) The provisions of this Act, as amended by the Enemy Property 

(Amendment and Validation) Act, 2010, shall have and shall be deemed 

always to have effect for all purposes as if the provisions of this Act, as 

amended by the said Act, had been in force at all material times; 

(b) any enemy property divested from the custodian to any person under 

the provisions of this act, as it stood immediately before the commencement of 

the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Act, 2010, shall stand 

transferred to and vest or continue to vest, free from all encumbrances, in the 

Custodian in the same manner as it was vested in the Custodian before such 

divesting of enemy property under the provisions of this Act, as amended by 

the aforesaid Act, were in force at all material times; 

(c) no suit or other proceeding shall, without prejudice to the generality 

of the foregoing provisions, be maintained or continued in any court or tribunal 

or authority for the enforcement of any decree or order or direction given by 

such court or tribunal or authority directing divestment of enemy property from 

the Custodian vested in him under section 5 of this Act, as it stood before the 

commencement of the Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Act, 

2010 and such enemy property shall continue to vest in the Custodian under 

section 5 of this act, as amended by the aforesaid Act, as the said section, as 

amended by the aforesaid Act, was in force at all material times; 



40 

(d) any transfer of any property, vested in Custodian, by virtue of nay 

orders of attachment, seizure or sale in execution of decree of a civil court or 

orders of any tribunal or other authority in respect of enemy property vested in 

the Custodian which is contrary to the provision of this Act, as amended by the 

Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Act, 2010, shall be deemed to 

be null and void and notwithstanding such transfer, continue to vest in the 

Custodian under this Act." 

14. In the Public Premises (Eviction of Unauthorized Occupants) Act, 

1971, 

(a) in section 2, in clause (e), after sub-clause (3), the following sub-

clause shall be inserted. namely:- 

"(4) any premises of the enemy property as defined in clause (c) of 

section 2 of the Enemy Property Act, 1968;" 

(b) in section 3, in clause (a)- 

(i) in the second proviso, the word "and" shall be omitted; 

(ii) after the second proviso, the following proviso shall be inserted, 

namely:- 

"Provided also that Custodian, Deputy Custodian and Assistant 

Custodian of the enemy property under section 3 of the Enemy Property Act, 

1968 shall be deemed to have been appointed as the Estate Officer in respect of 

those enemy property, being the public premises, referred to in sub-clause (4) 

of clause (e) of section 2 of this Act for which they had been appointed as the 

Custodian, Deputy Custodian and Assistant Custodian under section 3 of the 

Enemy Property Act, 1986. 

15. (1) The Enemy Property (Amendment and Validation) Ordinance, 

2010 is hereby repealed. 

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, anything done or any action taken 

under the Enemy Property Act, 1968 or the Public Premises (Eviction of 



41 

Unauthorized Occupants) Act, 1971 as amended by the said Ordinance, shall 

be deemed to have been done or taken under the corresponding provisions of 

those Acts as amended by this Act. 

Statement of Objects and Reasons 

The enemy property Act, 1968 was enacted on the 20th August, 1968 to, 

inter alia, provide for the continued vesting of enemy property vested in the 

Custodian of Enemy Property for India under the Defence of India Rules, 1962 

and for matter connected therewith. 

2. of late, there have been various judgments by various courts that have 

adversely affected the powers of the Custodian and the Government of India as 

provided under the Enemy Property Act, 1968. In view of such interpretation 

by various courts, the Custodian has finding it difficult to sustain his actions 

under the Enemy Property Act, 1968. 

3. In the above circumstances, it has become necessary to amend the 

Enemy Property Act, 1968, inter alia, to clarify the legislative intention with 

retrospective effect providing 

(a) that the enemy property shall continue to vest in the custodian till it is 

divested by the Central Government, even if the enemy subject or enemy firm 

ceases to be enemy due to death, extinction. Winding up of business or change 

of nationality or that the legal heir or successor is a citizen of India or citizen 

of a country which would be evidence of facts stated therein; 

(b) to authorized the Custodian, after making such enquiry as he deems 

necessary, to declare that the property of the enemy, or the enemy subject, or 

the enemy firm vest in him under the aforesaid Act and issue a certificate to 

that effect which would be evidence of facts stated therein; 

(c) that the transfer of any enemy property shall not include any transfer 

or any claim of transfer made through oral will or oral gift or by concealment 

of enemy nationality or, in case the transfer of such property requires the 



42 

permission of the Reserve Bank India or any other competent authority, any 

transfer without such permission or without the permission of the Custodian; 

(d) that no court shall have jurisdiction to order divestment from the 

Custodian of enemy property vested in him under the aforesaid Act or direct 

the Central Government to divest such property from the Custodian, but the 

court shall have jurisdiction to adjudicate whether the property claimed to be 

vested in the custodian is an enemy property or not; 

(e) to authorize the Central Government to direct that any or all enemy 

property vested in the Custodian under the aforesaid Act shall be sold or 

disposes of in such manner as may be prescribed: 

(f) that any transfer or any other action taken contrary to the provisions 

of the aforesaid Act, as amended by the proposed legislation, would be null not 

void. 

4. in order to have speedy and effective eviction unauthorized occupants 

from the enemy property under the Custodian, it is proposed to amend the 

Public Premises (Eviction and Assistant Custodian of Enemy Property 

appointed under the Enemy Property Act, 1968 as "Estate officer" in respect of 

the enemy properties. 

5. As parliament was not in session and an urgent legislation was 

required to be made, the President promulgated the Enemy Property 

(Amendment and Validation) ordinance, 2010 on the 2nd July, 2010. 

6. The Bill seeks to replace the aforesaid Ordinance. 

P. Chidambaram 

New Delhi: 

The 22nd July, 2010 



 



43 




